Gibb, Abby

From: Lindeman, Barbara

Sent: Thursday, June 23, 2016 8:40 AM
Te: Gibb, Abby

Subject: FW: Project Update Request

From: CandaceF @theCl.com [mailto:_]

Sent: Thursday, June 23, 2016 8:29 AM
To: Lindeman, Barbara <Barbara.Lindeman@Springettsbury.com>
Subject: Project Update Request

Hi Barbara,

We are currently reparting the following project which recently bid. May I have the bid
tabulation? If it has been awarded, may I also have the name of the awarded contractor and
the award amount? If not et available, do you have an anticipated date the bid tab and/or
award will be released?

Thanks for iour helﬁl Candace Fersch

Construction Journal

Ad Hoc Grass Mowing Services
Project #:

York, PA

CI Project #1304098
Proposals Due: 05/24/16

View Project Report
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SPRINGETTSBURY
TOWNSHIP
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Police: 717-757-3525 Fax: 717-840-1908
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George M. Dvoryak
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Assistant Secretary/Treasurer

William H. Schenck, Il

Recreation Office: 717-505-0406

Wastewater Treatment Facility

COAT OF ARMS OF SPRINGETT PENN 3501 North Sherman Street

17011731 717-757-3521 Fax: 717-840-0680

June 24, 2016

Ms. Candace Fersch
Construction Journal

Re: RIGHT-TO-KNOW REQUEST - Ad Hoc Mowing (CJ Project #1304098)

Dear Ms. Fersch,
Thank you for writing to Springettsbury Township with your request for:
“...May I have the bid tabulation? If it has been awarded, may I also have the name of the awarded

contractor and the award amount? If not yet available, do you have an anticipated date the bid tab and/or
award will be released?”

Awarded: Bitting Lawn Service
Amount: Not to exceed $21,000 for 2016 and $22,000 for 2017

Additional Bids: All Seasons Lawn and Landscaping
Amount: $100 per hour for 2016 and 2017

Police and Fire Emergencies - Dial 911 Blanda’FNacs

Please be advised that this correspondence will serve to close this record with our office as permitted by

law.,
If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Vary truly yours,

V/Abega e Gibb
Right to Know Officer

cc: Dori Bowders, Manager of Administrative Operations
Barbara Lindeman, Director of Finance
Paul Shaefer, First Capital Engineering

File:  Right-to-Know 382





